
million.

While much of society would
prefer to keep wife beating in the

closet, Osarenren said the effects

of physical and sexual abuse on

the woman and the family are

great. "The woman who suffers

this kind of violence will

experience permanent emotional

disturbance occasioned by the

presence of the man.

"The woman will have poor

self-concept and low self-esteem.

Children lose respect for their fa

thers and at times challenge their

fathers. The children may become

insecure and the act of violence

against their mothers becomes

also a stigma," said Osarenren.

Some bodies, such as Women

in Nigeria (WIN), are taking a firm

stand in defense of battered

women. Toro Oladapo,

WIN's deputy coordina

tor told IPS the

organization had taken

up the case of a woman

who lost four teeth from

beating by her husband.

Oladapo said the case of assault

brought against the man was be

ing handled in court in

conjunction with the international

federation of female lawyers.

"WIN fights any move that

stands in the way of progress,"

said Oladapo. "We oppose any

harmful practice against women

and we will continue to fight for

our rights as a group. In fact we
are trying to set up legal
departments in all our branches
to handle such cases."

Dupe Ajayi, editor of the
Weekend Times, confirmed that

more women's organizations are
working hard to eradicate harmful
practices such as wife battering
and genital mutilation.

Ajayi said in an interview with
IPS: "The time has come for the

reform of laws concerning the
rights of women."

"Most of the women who

suffer battering are providers for
their families, they fend for the
children and even the husband.

In most cases, these wife batterers

are 'never do wells' who come

home to vent their frustrations on

their wives," she argued.

Source: Inter Press Service 29 April

1997

Video shows torture in East

Timor

GENEVA—A blood-covered

youth nailed to a wooden table

was among the many gruesome

images in a video presented by

Nobel Peace laureate Jose Ramos-

Horta to show Indonesian soldiers

torturing East Timor civilians.

The self-exiled East Timor

independence leader showed

reporters the video of still

images during a hearing

of the UN Human

Rights Commission

and called for a full

investigation into torture

there.

Invaded by Indonesia in

1975 during a civil war following
the end of400 years of Portuguese

colonial rule, East Timor was an

nexed a year later. Subsequently,

Indonesia has faced a pro-

independence campaign marked

by low-level guerrilla warfare.

Human rights groups say

Indonesian troops have tortured,
beaten and killed thousands of

East Timorese to stifle separatist

yearnings.

Besides pictures of the
crucified youth were images of a

man in fatigues ramming a large

metal pole down a prisoner's
throat, a blindfolded victim being
burned with cigarettes and
choked with chains, and corpses

covered by dirty banners bearing
mocking messages or simply

dumped in shallow graves.
The East Timorese separatist

spokesperson said the pictures

had been taken in East Timor

prisons in Dili in November 1996

and recently smuggled out.
"They are consistent with the

Indonesian practice of docu

menting their own torture,
executions, or soldiers taking
pictures as souvenirs, like

trophies," said Ramos-Horta, who

shared the 1996 Nobel Peace prize
with Roman Catholic Bishop
Carlos Belo, the religious leader

of East Timor.

Source: Philippine Daily Inquirer, 10

April 1997

Child Labor Rising in the South

From the brothels of Asia to

the carpet factories of Pakistan,

250 million children aged five to

14, or almost twice as many as

the 73 million previously thought,
are employed in countries in the
South. Half of them are employed

full-time, according to a report by
the International Labor Organiza

tion, a United Nations agency.
The ILO report, based on in-

depth surveys and interviews,
estimates 153 million children are
working in Asia, 80 million in Af
rica. and 17.5 million in Latin
America. The ILO also calls for a
new international accord that
shall ban the harshest forms of
child labor: prostitution, slavery
and work in hazardous industries.
(The new accord would replace the
1976 child-labor convention,
which has only been ratified by
49 UN member countries.)

Michael Hansenne. director-

general of ILO, states that child
labor only perpetuates an endless
cycle of illiteracy and poverty. He
added that "slavery" is still

practised in parts of South Asia.
Southeast Asia and West Africa,

where children are "sold" by their

impoverished families and forced

to work in factories and as

prostitutes.

The ILO notes that child
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